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BERMAGUI  

PRESCHOOL  
 

 

Narelle Myers 

 

 

Bermagui Preschool acknowledges that early childhood is a time of rapid growth and 
development and that designating a suitably qualified person is essential in leading the 
educational program. The Educational Leader has an influential role in inspiring, motivating, 
affirming and also challenging or extending the practice and pedagogy of educators. 
 
 
 
The program of education and care within an early childhood setting will be founded in 
service values and philosophy and will be further supported by policy. An Educational Leader, 
through a collaborative process, involving inquiry and reflection with educators, families and 
the community, will guide the development of the program of learning and education for 
children. They will also assist with educator growth in reflection and the understanding of 
children’s learning and development.  

 

The Educational Leader role is part of Quality Area 7 - Leadership and Service Management 
in the National Quality Standard (NQS). Standard 7.1 in the NQS requires that effective 
leadership promotes a positive organisational culture and builds a professional learning 
community. Further to this, element 7.1.4 requires that provision is made to ensure a suitably 
qualified and experienced educator or coordinator leads the development of the curriculum 
and ensures the establishment of clear goals and expectations for teaching and learning.                                 

 

Supporting this, regulation 118 of the Education and Care Service National Regulations 
requires that the approved provider designate, in writing, a suitably qualified and experienced 
educator, coordinator or other individual as Educational Leader at the service to lead the 
development and implementation of educational programs in the service.   

 

When designating an Educational Leader, consideration needs to be given to whether the 
person is:  

• suitably qualified and experienced  

• willing to make time for the role and eager to learn more  

• approachable and well respected  

• knowledgeable about theories, pedagogy and the relevant learning frameworks  

• skilled at supporting educators of varying abilities and learning styles  

• knowledgeable about the NQS and related regulatory standards.  

 

The most effective Educational Leader views their role as collegial and seeks to play an 
integral role in mentoring, guiding and supporting educators.    
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As part of continuous improvement, the Educational Leader should consider what strategies 
are needed to improve the educational program in the approved service. Strategies might 
include:  

• leading and being part of reflective discussions about practice and implementing the 

learning framework  

• mentoring other educators by leading quality practice  

• discussing routines and how to make them more effective learning experiences  

• observing children and educator interactions, and making suggestions on how to improve  

interactions and intentional teaching  

• talking to parents about the educational program 

• working with other early childhood professionals such maternal and child health nurses 

and early childhood intervention specialists  

• considering how the program can be linked to the community by working with other 

community services and groups such as Aboriginal Elders 

• establishing systems across the service to ensure there is continuity of learning when 

children change room or attend other services, and then in their transition to school  

• assisting with documenting children’s learning and how these assessments can inform 

curriculum decision making. 
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